BID SUMMARY

Hammond Northshore Regional Airport - PHASE I - Drainage Improvements

for the City of Hammond
Bid Opening: Tuesday, June 11, 2013, 10 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC
BIDDER La. Contr. BASE BID Add. Alt. No. 1 Add. Alt. No. 2 Bid Time
License No.| items "1." -"39." NET BID NET BID Rank Rec'd *

1. Beverly Industries, LLC 35678 NO BID $ - $ -

1215 River Road; Bridge City, LA 70094 $ =
2. Boh Brothers Const. Co., LL.C $ 36,000.00 | $ 130,200.00 )

730 Tonti Street; New Orleans, LA 70119 2 % 1,211,490.00 $ 1,247,490.00 | $§ 1,377,690.00 7] 7:30.am
3. Circle Construction (2) $ 65,200.00 | $ 141,750.00 .

. 9:45

1204 Engineers Road; Belle Chasse, LA 70037 2074 | % 128521500 $ 1,350,415.00 | §  1,492,165.00 8] 45 am
4. Command Constructipp, LLC 48896 NO BID $ - $ -

3206 N. Turnbull Dr.; Metairie, LA 70002 $ -
5. ERS, Inc. $ 51,500.00 | $ 138,600.00 .

4526 Office Pk Dr Suite 2; Jackson, MS 39206 et $ 1,127,127.00 $ 1,178,627.00 | $ 1,317,227.00 [6] 9:22 am
6. Fenton Excavating.& Constr. Inc. 50078 NO BID $ - $ -

44311 Reynolds Dr.; Clinton Twp., MI 48036 $ -
7. Industrial Enterprises $ 73,887.50 | $ 149,730.00

6/10-3:25
P. O. Box 15414; Baton Rouge, LA 70895 S T $ 1,615,518.74 | § 1,765,248.74 (] o

Additional Bids listed on next page

NOTES TO BID OPENING:

* Received at Hammond City Hall Tuesday, June 11, 2013, unless otherwise noted

(a) No unit price entered for bid item "41."; extension entered = "$141,750.00"

(b)

Certified Correct:

T. C. Spanglér) Jr., PE.
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BID SUMMARY

Hammond Northshore Regional Airport - PHASE I - Drainage Improvements
for the City of Hammond
Bid Opening: Tuesday, June 11, 2013, 10 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC
BIDDER La. Contr. BASE BID Add. Alt. No. 1 Add. Alt. No. 2 Bid Time
License No.| items "1." - "39." NET BID NET BID Rank Rec'd *
8. Insituform Technologies $ - $ -
580 Goddard Ave.; Chesterfield, MO 63005 2640 NG BID $ -
9. Kort's Trucking, Inc. $ 30,000.00 | $ 115,500.00 :
’ 9356 2 . 9:39 am
19317 N. 10th St. (Suite D); Covington, 70433 & 982 075.00 $ 1,012,075.00 $ 1,127,575.00 [4] @
10. Lawson-Bonet Construction, Inc. 39990 949,132.00 $ 36,000.00 | $ 123,900.00 [1] 943 am
P. O. Box 1313; Hammond, LA 70404 $ 985,132.00 | $ 1,109,032.00
i i i 24,000.00 126 !
11. Richard Price Contracting Co, LLC 14807 964.381.00 $ . $ ,000.00 2] | 9:43am
25509 Walker South Rd.; D.S., LA 70726 $ 988,381.00 [ § 1,114,381.00
12. Stranco, Inc. $ 35,640.00 | $ 145,530.00 _
: 2
70459 Hwy. 59; Abita Springs, LA 70420 16724 1,089,532.00 $ 1,125,172.00 [ §  1,270,702.00 (5] 47am
13. Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc. 12198 970,554.50 $ 72,000.00 | $ 126,000.00 3] 9:43 am
24288 Hwy. 190; Robert, LA 70455 $ 1,042,554.50 | $  1,168,554.50
14. Thigpen .Constructlon Co., Inc. 4435 NO BID $ - $ -
361 Almedia Rd.; St. Rose, LA 70087 $ -
* Received at Hammond City Hall Tuesday, June 11, 2013, unless otherwise noted
NOTES TO BID OPENING:
(©)
(d

Certified Correct:
T. C. angléi), Jr.,('f’.E.
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