



Spangler Engineering LLC

CONSULTING CIVIL ENGINEERS

T. C. Spangler, Jr., P.E.
Kiley F. Bates, P.E.
Webb M. Anderson, P.E.

October 11, 2013

Honorable Mayson Foster, Mayor
and City Council
City of Hammond
P. O. Box 2788
Hammond, LA 70404

RE: Sewer Rehabilitation
--Infiltration/Inflow Repairs
LaDEQ CWSRF 221741-01
City of Hammond
City Project # 616-31401

Gentlemen:

We have reviewed bids received October 11, 2013, on above-referenced project, and recommend awarding to the low bidder, Insituform Technologies, LLC, for the Base Bid plus Additive Alternate No. 1 in the amount of \$3,847,155.00. (Additive Alternate No. 1 is the expansion of cured-in-place pipe lining on service laterals.)

Attached are the "Bid Summary", "Bid Tabulation", and Project Budget. Webb Anderson, P.E., will be present at the October 15, 2013, city council meeting if you have any comments or questions.

Sincerely,

T. C. Spangler, Jr., P.E.

Attachments

cc: Mr. Garry Knight
Ms. Diane Partridge, Insituform Technologies
Mr. Will Bartlett, P.E., LaDEQ
Ms. Lacy Landrum

BID SUMMARY

Sewer Rehabilitation - Infiltration/Inflow Repairs - LaDEQ CWSRF 221741-01

for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Friday, October 11, 2013, 10 a.m.

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC

BIDDER	La. Contr. License No.	BASE BID items "1." - "41."	Add. Alt. No. 1 NET BID	Time Rec'd*	Bid Rank
1. BLD Services, LLC 2424 Tyler St.; Kenner, LA 70062	46722	NO BID	\$ -		
2. Boh Brothers Const. Co., LLC 730 Tonti Street; New Orleans, LA 70119	2179	NO BID	\$ -		
3. Grady Crawford Const. Co. P. O. Box 967; Baton Rouge, LA 70821	7764	\$ 5,351,881.66	\$ 579,600.00 \$ 5,931,481.66	9:26 am	[4]
4. Insituform Technologies, LLC (a) 580 Goddard Ave.; Chesterfield, MO 63005	26836	\$ 3,486,255.00	\$ 360,900.00 \$ 3,847,155.00	9:26 am	[1]
5. Layne Christensen Company 1900 Shawnee M. Pkwy; Shawnee Mission, KS 66201	10071	NO BID	\$ -		
6. Magnolia Construction Co., LLC P. O. Box 66096; Baton Rouge, LA 70896	38553	NO BID	\$ -		
7. Suncoast Infrastructure, Inc. 1858 Hwy. 49 South; Florence, MS 39073	36634	\$ 3,856,460.00	\$ 465,000.00 \$ 4,321,460.00	9:37 am	[2]
8. Wallace C. Drennan, Inc. 1500 Nine Mile Pt. Rd.; Westwego, LA 70094	1033	NO BID	\$ -		
9. Wharton-Smith, Inc. 17474 Opportunity Ave.; Baton Rouge 70817	52227	\$ 4,057,900.00	\$ 543,945.00 \$ 4,601,845.00	9:34 am	[3]

* Time received at Hammond City Hall, Friday, Oct. 11, 2013 unless otherwise noted

NOTES TO BID OPENING:

(a) Error in Base Bid total: **\$3,486,255.00 actual** vs. "\$3,486,155.00" written

Certified Correct:

T. C. Spangler, Jr., P.E.

11-Oct-2013

DATE

OVERALL PROJECT BUDGET
Sewer Rehabilitation - Infiltration/Inflow Repairs
 LaDEQ CWSRF CS221741-01
 City of Hammond

11-Oct-2013

<i>Construction Budget :</i>				AMOUNT
A. Sewer Rehabilitation - Infiltration/Inflow Repairs [Insituform Tech.]				\$ 3,847,155.00
B. Construction Contingencies				732,845.00
TOTAL Construction BUDGET:				\$ 4,580,000.00
<i>Other Costs:</i>				
C. Engineering Fees	<i>I+I Repairs</i>	Lump Sum		\$ 267,000.00
D. Environmental / Engineering Report		0.00%	\$ 4,580,000	-
E. Construction Inspection	<i>I+I Repairs</i>	Lump Sum		97,000.00
F. Lab costs/QA/QC				2,500.00
G. Legal Costs/cost of issue				49,824.25
H. Permits/Surveys				1,500.00
I. LaDEQ Grant Administration / Labor Compliance				-
J. Miscellaneous Costs/fees				2,175.75
<i>Sub-Total "Other Costs":</i>				\$ 420,000.00
Total Project Budget:				\$ 5,000,000.00

REVENUES	
LaDEQ Revolving Loan	\$ 5,000,000.00
City of Hammond Sewer Capital Impr. Appropriation FY2013-14	-
TOTAL PROJECT REVENUES:	\$ 5,000,000.00