BID SUMMARY

Bulkhead Improvements [FY 2016]

for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Friday, September 15, 2017, 10:00 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC
La. Contr. BASE BID ADD. ALT. No. 1 Bid
BIDDER Lic. No. items "1."-"23." NET BID Rank*
1. APC Construction, LL.C (a)(c) $ 120,534.55
1910 Peters Road, Harvey, LA 70058 S35 535,494.00 974,026.55 o
2. Ashley Savarino Unlimited Construction, LL.C (¢) $ 40,699.21
1001 Justin Road, Metairie, LA 70001 Gkl $ 1’145’394'32 1,186,093.53 12
3. Baker Pile Driving & Site Work (b) 73,080.00
1051 Ronald Reagan Highway, Covington, LA 70433 39613 175,465.00 847,045.00 3
4. Boh Bros. Construction Co., LL.C (b) 51,025.00
P.O. Drawer 53266, New Orleans, LA 70153 2179 L 948,685.00 9
5. Chambers Construction Co., LLC (c) 56,201.60
18287 Swamp Road, Prairieville, LA 70769 2109 731,737.50 787,939.10 [1]
6. Circle Construction, LLC 2074 NO BID - _
1204 Engineers Road, Belle Chasse, LA 70037 -
7. Coastal Bridge Co., LLC 142,775.00
4825 Jamestown Ave., Baton Rouge, LA 70808 al 126445000 1,407,225.00 13
8. Command Construction, LLLC 54,400.00
3206 Turnbull Drive, Metairie, LA 70002 AHlDS 852,425.00 906,825.00 6
9. Cycle Construction Company, LL.C -
6 East Third Street, Kenner, LA 70062 56361 NO BID - )
10. D&D Construction -
628 Peters Road, Harvey, LA 70158 ST7a8 NO BID - )
11. ERS, Inc. 78,260.00
4526 Office Park Drive, Suite 2, Jackson, MS 39206 32784 75050 1,156,338.00 11
12. Guinn Construction, LL.C (a) 102,350.00
1616 Industrial Drive, Jennings, LA 70546 44 908,650.00 1,011,000.00 10
13. Kostmayer Constructin, LL.C 25747 NO BID - _
1080 Old Spanish Trail, Suite 14, Slidell, LA 70458 -
14. Lawson-Bonet Construction, Inc. 39990 NO BID - _
P.O. Box 1313, Hammond, LA 70404 =
15. The Lemoine Company, LLC (a) 42,815.00
214 Jefferson St. Suite 200, Lafayette, LA 70501 S2600 845,296.00 888,111.00 5
16. Lil Man Construction, LLC -
P.0. Box 1492, Hammond, LA 70404 =Eis ORI - )
17. Matt L. Guinn Construction, LL.C 59,860.00
1716 Industrial Drive, Jennings, LA 70546 An94 832,960.00 892,820.00 4
18. T.L. Wallace Construction, Inc. 55,970.00
14422 751,755. .
4025 Hwy 35 North, Columbia, MS 39424 3L 45340 807,725.00 2
19. Volute, Inc. 53,545.00
313 Venture Blvd., Houma, LA 70403-4146 D843 885,459.00 939,004.00 8
NOTES TO BID OPENING:
* Results based on "BASE BID"
(a) Contractor not a registered plan holder
(b) The amount bid for item "1. Mobilization" exceeded 10% of total base bid amount
(c) Error: Written unit price extension vs. actual resulting in error of bid total
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BID TABULATION
Bulkhead Improvements [FY 2016] - for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Friday, September 15, 2017, 10:00 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers
Bid Engineer's Estimate Chambers Construction (c) T.L. Wallace Baker Pile Driving (b) T Matt L. Guinn Construction
ltem Description Bid Quantity]  Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension
1.|Mobilization 1|EA | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 33,793.90 | $ 33,793.90 | $ 53,000.00 | $ 53,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 [ $ 50,000.00
2.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 2,000.00 2,000.00 4,642.80 4,642.80 5,500.00 5,500.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,500.00 5,500.00
3.|Install Steel Sheet Pile (PZ40)(38 VF) 265|LF 2,600.00 [ 689,000.00 1,950.90 516,988.50 1,900.00 | 503,500.00 1,740.00 461,100.00 2,085.00 | 552,525.00
4.|Install Type VIII Catch Basin 3|EA 2,500.00 7,500.00 2,883.20 8,649.60 3,000.00 9,000.00 5,500.00 16,500.00 4,500.00 13,500.00
5.|Demolition 1|EA 20,000.00 20,000.00 22,359.80 22,359.80 27,000.00 27,000.00 22,525.00 22,525.00 40,000.00 40,000.00
6.|Install HMA Street (8" th.) 110|SY 110.00 12,100.00 159.30 17,523.00 125.00 13,750.00 140.00 15,400.00 115.00 12,650.00
7.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 400|CY 15.00 6,000.00 31.00 12,400.00 28.00 11,200.00 31.25 12,500.00 58.00 23,200.00
8.|Install new GUARDRAIL 285|LF 30.00 8,550.00 18.00 5,130.00 39.00 11,115.00 11.00 3,135.00 35.00 9,975.00
9.|Install new Guardrail POST 45|EA 75.00 3,375.00 85.60 3,852.00 50.00 2,250.00 125.00 5,625.00 100.00 4,500.00
10.|Tie-in Existing Pipe to NEW Pipe 2|EA 500.00 1,000.00 918.40 1,836.80 1,500.00 3,000.00 1,500.00 3,000.00 1,250.00 2,500.00
11.|Tie-in NEW Pipe to NEW Sheet Pile 3|EA 2,000.00 6,000.00 2,233.10 6,699.30 2,500.00 7,500.00 2,700.00 8,100.00 1,850.00 5,550.00
12.|Install Slab Sod 160|SY 7.00 1,120.00 10.10 1,616.00 12.00 1,920.00 15.00 2,400.00 7.00 1,120.00
13.|Haul-in/Fine grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas.)] 700|CF 2.00 1,400.00 2.00 1,400.00 2.00 1,400.00 2.00 1,400.00 3.70 2,590.00
14.|Unclassified Excavation 300(CY 10.00 3,000.00 41.90 12,570.00 25.00 7,500.00 32.00 9,600.00 21.00 6,300.00
15.|Install 15" ACCMP 20|LF 45.00 900.00 76.70 1,534.00 85.00 1,700.00 65.00 1,300.00 100.00 2,000.00
16.|Install 15" RCP 16|LF 60.00 960.00 80.50 1,288.00 180.00 2,880.00 250.00 4,000.00 105.00 1,680.00
17.|Install 24" RCP 16|LF 75.00 1,200.00 106.10 1,697.60 200.00 3,200.00 275.00 4,400.00 105.00 1,680.00
18.|Install 6" PVC French Drain 220(LF 12.00 2,640.00 23.30 5,126.00 32.00 7,040.00 44.00 9,680.00 57.00 12,540.00
19.|Install PCC Headwall [12" th.] 80|SF 40.00 3,200.00 171.20 13,696.00 65.00 5,200.00 170.00 13,600.00 290.00 23,200.00
20.|Connect New/Exst. Headwall to New Sheet Pile 2|EA 2,500.00 5,000.00 3,098.30 6,196.60 5,000.00 10,000.00 6,000.00 12,000.00 5,500.00 11,000.00
21.|Install PCC Sheet Pile Cap 285|LF 25.00 7,125.00 151.10 43,063.50 160.00 45,600.00 220.00 62,700.00 170.00 48,450.00
22.|Miscellaneous Sitework 1|EA 10,000.00 10,000.00 9,674.10 9,674.10 18,500.00 18,500.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00
23.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 0[SY 100.00 - 75.90 - 115.00 - 120.00 - 75.00 -
Total BASE BID [items "1." through "23.":| $ 812,070.00 | $ 731,737.50 | $ 751,755.00 | $ 773,965.00 | $ 832,960.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE No. ONE (1) — For Addition of C. M. Fagan Drive Bank Stabilization
Bid Add. Alt. 1 Engineer's Estimate Chambers Construction (c) T.L. Wallace Baker Pile Driving (b) Matt L. Guinn Construction
Iltem Description Bid Quantity]  Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension Unit Price |  Extension Unit Price Extension
1A.|Mobilization 1|EA | $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 | $ 14,963.20 | $ 14,963.20| $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00| $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 [ $ 3,000.00
2A.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,345.90 2,345.90 4,700.00 4,700.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
7A.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 430|CY 15.00 6,450.00 30.00 12,900.00 33.00 14,190.00 50.00 21,500.00 58.00 24,940.00
12A. |Install Slab Sod 265|SY 8.00 2,120.00 8.00 2,120.00 12.00 3,180.00 12.00 3,180.00 7.00 1,855.00
13A.|Install/Fine Grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas.| 1,200(CF 2.00 2,400.00 2.50 3,000.00 2.00 2,400.00 2.00 2,400.00 3.70 4,440.00
23A.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 275(SY 100.00 27,500.00 75.90 20,872.50 100.00 27,500.00 120.00 33,000.00 75.00 20,625.00
Total ADD. ALT. No. 1 BID:| $ 50,970.00 | $ 56,201.60 | $ 55,970.00 | $ 73,080.00 | $ 59,860.00
NET BID - Base Bid Plus Add. Alt. No. 1:| $ 863,040.00 | $ 787,939.10 | $ 807,725.00 | $ 847,045.00 | $ L ,,,,892 820.00
Notes to Bid Opening: (a) Contractor not a resigistered plan holder Certified Correct: ,Q; 12 <= (M S &
(b) The amount bid for item "1. Mobilization" exceeded 10% of total base bid amount Jay C. Pittman, P.E. S M‘[,‘égfgm glg‘ro?gm g
(c) Error: Written unit price extension vs. actual resulting in error of bid total E,, P"gﬁgﬂgyl. &
’/,/o \\

, JEn ER“\ N
Prepared by Jay C. Pittman, P.E. 11y ,(,;lglage\ﬁ\\of 3



BID TABULATION

Bulkhead Improvements [FY 2016] - for the City of Hammond

Bid Opening: Friday, September 15, 2017, 10:00 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers
Bid Lemoine Company (a) Command Construction APC (a)(c) Volute Boh Bros. (b)
ltem Description Bid Quantity]  Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1.|Mobilization 1|EA | $ 84,000.00 | $ 84,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 35,016.25 | $ 35,016.25| $ 69,000.00 | $ 69,000.00| $ 90,000.00 | $ 90,000.00
2.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 6,000.00 6,000.00 10,500.00 10,500.00 19,501.06 19,501.06 6,000.00 6,000.00 25,000.00 25,000.00
3.|Install Steel Sheet Pile (PZ40)(38 VF) 265|LF 2,315.00 | 613,475.00 1,865.00 494,225.00 2,039.91 540,576.15 2,360.00 625,400.00 1,588.00 | 420,820.00
4.|Install Type VIII Catch Basin 3|EA 1,685.00 5,055.00 5,000.00 15,000.00 8,752.85 26,258.55 3,700.00 11,100.00 6,000.00 18,000.00
5.|Demolition 1|EA 14,000.00 14,000.00 55,000.00 55,000.00 34,465.48 34,465.48 26,800.00 26,800.00 55,000.00 55,000.00
6.|Install HMA Street (8" th.) 110|SY 133.00 14,630.00 400.00 44,000.00 396.85 43,653.50 216.00 23,760.00 125.00 13,750.00
7.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 400(CY 21.00 8,400.00 25.00 10,000.00 56.33 22,532.00 23.00 9,200.00 30.00 12,000.00
8.|Install new GUARDRAIL 285(|LF 10.00 2,850.00 20.00 5,700.00 13.67 3,895.95 11.00 3,135.00 10.00 2,850.00
9.|Install new Guardrail POST 45|EA 118.00 5,310.00 20.00 900.00 162.35 7,305.75 126.00 5,670.00 125.00 5,625.00
10.|Tie-in Existing Pipe to NEW Pipe 2|EA 520.00 1,040.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 2,018.41 4,036.82 530.00 1,060.00 4,000.00 8,000.00
11.|Tie-in NEW Pipe to NEW Sheet Pile 3|EA 672.00 2,016.00 10,000.00 30,000.00 2,474.95 7,424 .85 661.00 1,983.00 10,000.00 30,000.00
12.|Install Slab Sod 160|SY 10.00 1,600.00 20.00 3,200.00 13.45 2,152.00 20.00 3,200.00 13.00 2,080.00
13.|Haul-in/Fine grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas.)] 700|CF 2.00 1,400.00 10.00 7,000.00 1.00 700.00 3.50 2,450.00 3.00 2,100.00
14.|Unclassified Excavation 300(CY 13.00 3,900.00 50.00 15,000.00 58.66 17,598.00 14.00 4,200.00 45.00 13,500.00
15.|Install 15" ACCMP 20(LF 95.00 1,900.00 200.00 4,000.00 348.00 6,960.00 102.00 2,040.00 200.00 4,000.00
16.|Install 15" RCP 16|LF 91.00 1,456.00 200.00 3,200.00 122.91 1,966.56 60.00 960.00 250.00 4,000.00
17.|Install 24" RCP 16|LF 130.00 2,080.00 250.00 4,000.00 110.23 1,763.68 131.00 2,096.00 260.00 4,160.00
18.|Install 6" PVC French Drain 220(LF 27.00 5,940.00 50.00 11,000.00 62.22 13,688.40 37.00 8,140.00 25.00 5,500.00
19.|Install PCC Headwall [12" th.] 80|SF 43.00 3,440.00 100.00 8,000.00 132.23 10,578.40 133.00 10,640.00 250.00 20,000.00
20.|Connect New/Exst. Headwall to New Sheet Pile 2|EA 4,707.00 9,414.00 2,500.00 5,000.00 7,541.08 15,082.16 4,100.00 8,200.00 20,000.00 40,000.00
21.|Install PCC Sheet Pile Cap 285|LF 192.00 54,720.00 120.00 34,200.00 76.03 21,668.55 205.00 58,425.00 415.00 | 118,275.00
22.|Miscellaneous Sitework 1|EA 2,670.00 2,670.00 10,500.00 10,500.00 16,667.89 16,667.89 2,000.00 2,000.00 3,000.00 3,000.00
23.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 0[SY 80.00 - 100.00 - 112.00 - 77.00 - 25.00 -
Total BASE BID [items "1." through "23.":| $ 845,296.00 | $ 852,425.00 | $ 853,492.00 | $ 885,459.00 | $ 897,660.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE No. ONE (1) — For Addition of C. M. Fagan Drive Bank Stabilization
Bid Add. Alt. 1 Lemoine Company (a) Command Construction APC (a)(c) Volute Boh Bros. (b)
ltem Description Bid Quantity]  Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1A.[Mobilization 1lEA | $ 5,000.00 |$ 5,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2,23285|% 223285]| $ 5,300.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 5,000.00 [ $ 5,000.00
2A.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 1,830.00 1,830.00 500.00 500.00 22,055.85 22,055.85 7,680.00 7,680.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
7A.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 430|CY 20.00 8,600.00 20.00 8,600.00 79.83 34,326.90 23.00 9,890.00 30.00 12,900.00
12A.|Install Slab Sod 265(SY 9.00 2,385.00 20.00 5,300.00 14.13 3,744.45 20.00 5,300.00 10.00 2,650.00
13A.|Install/Fine Grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas| 1,200|CF 2.50 3,000.00 10.00 12,000.00 1.00 1,200.00 3.50 4,200.00 3.00 3,600.00
23A.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 275|SY 80.00 22,000.00 100.00 27,500.00 207.18 56,974.50 77.00 21,175.00 25.00 6,875.00
Total ADD. ALT. No. 1 BID:| $ 42,815.00 | $ 54,400.00 | $ 120,534.55 | $ 53,545.00| $ 51,025.00
NET BID - Base Bid Plus Add. Alt. No. 1:| $ 888,111.00 I $ 906,825.00 | $ 974,026.55 I $ 939,004.00 | $ \‘“,,948 685.00
Notes to Bid Opening: (a) Contractor not a resigistered plan holder Certified Correct: Aw Cs. é \DEReT ]

Jay COLDON PITTMAN

(b) The amount bid for item "1. Mobilization" exceeded 10% of total base bid amount Jay C. Pittman, P.E. = F COLDON PITYM £
- nse No. —
(c) Error: Written unit price extension vs. actual resulting in error of bid total Z PREOJESSIONAL <
Z GINEER <
%, ¢ IN N
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BID TABULATION

Bulkhead Improvements [FY 2016] - for the City of Hammond

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers

ENGINEER

Bid Opening: Friday, September 15, 2017, 10:00 a.m.
Bid Guinn Construction (a) ERS A. Savarino Unl. Const. (c) Coastal Bridge
Item Description Bid Quantity]  Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1.|Mobilization 1|EA | $ 22,500.00 | $ 22,500.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 [ $ 75,000.00| $ 100,000.00 [ $ 100,000.00
2.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 8,000.00 8,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 10,000.00 10,000.00
3.|Install Steel Sheet Pile (PZ40)(38 VF) 265|LF 2,148.00 | 569,220.00 2,950.00 781,750.00 2,735.85 | 725,000.25 2,230.00 590,950.00
4.|Install Type VIII Catch Basin 3|EA 5,000.00 15,000.00 6,000.00 18,000.00 4,166.67 12,500.01 10,000.00 30,000.00
5.|Demolition 1|EA 60,000.00 60,000.00 56,000.00 56,000.00 77,895,39 77,895.39 125,000.00 125,000.00
6.|Install HMA Street (8" th.) 110|SY 115.00 12,650.00 150.00 16,500.00 204.55 22,499.95 325.00 35,750.00
7.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 400|CY 50.00 20,000.00 31.00 12,400.00 37.50 15,000.00 65.00 26,000.00
8.|Install new GUARDRAIL 285|LF 40.00 11,400.00 86.00 24,510.00 70.18 19,999.88 10.00 2,850.00
9.|Install new Guardrail POST 45(EA 100.00 4,500.00 20.00 900.00 S99.39 14,999.85 125.00 5,625.00
10.|Tie-in Existing Pipe to NEW Pipe 2|1EA 2,000.00 4,000.00 2,250.00 4,500.00 4,250.00 8,500.00 3,500.00 7,000.00
11.|Tie-in NEW Pipe to NEW Sheet Pile 3|EA 3,850.00 11,550.00 2,252.00 6,756.00 5,500.00 16,500.00 12,500.00 37,500.00
12.|Install Slab Sod 160|SY 15.00 2,400.00 9.00 1,440.00 4.53 724.48 25.00 4,000.00
13.|Haul-in/Fine grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas.)] 700|CF 10.00 7,000.00 8.01 5,607.00 21.43 14,999.60 11.00 7,700.00
14.|Unclassified Excavation 300|CY 12.00 3,600.00 20.00 6,000.00 61.67 18,500.10 55.00 16,500.00
15.|Install 15" ACCMP 20|LF 120.00 2,400.00 90.00 1,800.00 175.00 3,500.00 250.00 5,000.00
16.|Install 15" RCP 16|LF 175.00 2,800.00 95.00 1,520.00 218.75 3,500.00 250.00 4,000.00
17.|Install 24" RCP 16|LF 200.00 3,200.00 140.00 2,240.00 218.75 3,500.00 300.00 4,800.00
18.|Install 6" PVC French Drain 220(LF 20.00 4,400.00 34.00 7,480.00 36.36 7,999.86 125.00 27,500.00
19.|Install PCC Headwall [12" th.] 80|SF 150.00 12,000.00 200.00 16,000.00 206.25 16,500.00 255.00 20,400.00
20.|Connect New/Exst. Headwall to New Sheet Pile 2|EA 2,500.00 5,000.00 3,000.00 6,000.00 4,637.50 9,275.00 7,500.00 15,000.00
21.|Install PCC Sheet Pile Cap 285|LF 158.00 45,030.00 55.00 15,675.00 228.07 64,999.95 575.00 163,875.00
22.|Miscellaneous Sitework 1|EA 82,000.00 82,000.00 55,000.00 55,000.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 25,000.00 25,000.00
23.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 0[SY 125.00 - 85.00 - 10,000.00 - 1,000.00 -
Total BASE BID [items "1." through "23.":{ $ 908,650.00 1,078,078.00 | $ 1,145,394.32 | $ 1,264,450.00
ADDITIVE ALTERNATE No. ONE (1) — For Addition of C. M. Fagan Drive Bank Stabilization
Bid Add. Alt. 1 Guinn Construction (a) ERS A. Savarino Unl. Const. (¢) Coastal Bridge
Item Description Bid Quantity] Unit Price | Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1A.|Mobilization 1|EA | $ 22,500.00 | $ 22,500.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00| $ 30,000.00|9% 30,000.00
2A.|Install/Maintain Construction & Traffic Signage 1|EA 8,000.00 8,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 10,000.00
7A.|Haul-in/Grade/Compact BACKFILL (trk. meas.) 430|CY 50.00 21,500.00 30.00 12,900.00 19.77 8,499.81 65.00 27,950.00
12A.|Install Slab Sod 265|SY 15.00 3,975.00 9.00 2,385.00 4.53 1,199.92 25.00 6,625.00
13A. |Install/Fine Grade Root Zone Mat'l (6" th.)(trk. meas.| 1,200|CF 10.00 12,000.00 8.00 9,600.00 7.08 8,499.60 11.00 13,200.00
23A.|Haul-in/Grade Limestone (55#, 24" thk.) 275|SY 125.00 34,375.00 85.00 23,375.00 54.55 14,999.88 200.00 55,000.00
Total ADD. ALT. No. 1 BID:| $ 102,350.00 78,260.00 | $ 40,699.21 1 $ 142,775.00
NET BID - Base Bid Plus Add. Alt. No. 1:| $ 1,011,000.00 | $ 1,156,338.00 | $ 1,186,093.52 | $ 1,407,225.00 oy
Notes to Bid Opening: (a) Contractor not a resigistered plan holder Certified Correct: X&A Ca Qa-:’,.._ 1B 177 =
(b) The amount bid for item "1. Mobilization" exceeded 10% of total base bid amount e Jay C. Pittman, P.E. = Lcene o 30059
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(c) Error: Written unit price extension vs. actual resulting in error of bid total
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