BID SUMMARY

Drainage Improvements [FY 2018]

for the City of Hammond
Bid Opening: Friday, April 20, 2018, 10:00 a.m. Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC
La. Contr. BASE BID Bid
BIDDER License No. items "1."-"34." Rank
1. Beverly Industries, LLC
1215 River Road; Bridge City, LA 70094 35678 1§ 1,165,000.00 [8]
2. Byron E. Talbot Contractor, Inc.
2 .
24288 Hwy. 190; Robert, LA 70455 12198 $ 1,020,382.50 [7]
3. Hard Rock Construction, LLC ‘
1255 Peters Road; Harvey, LA 70058 24901 § 863,150.00 [6]
4. Industrial Enterprise, Inc.
P. O. Box 15414; Baton Rouge, LA 70895 5693 ¥ 803,886.26 [3]
S. Insituform Technologies, L.LC 26836 NO BID
580 Goddard Avenue; Chesterfield, MO 63005
6. Kort's Construction Services
2182 Manton Drive; Covington, LA 70433 49356 NO BID
7. Lawson-Bonet Construction, Inc. :
P. O. Box 1313; Hammond, LA 70404 39990 NO BID
8. Magee Excavation & Development, LLC
P. O. Box245; Covington, LA 70434 54896 $ 817,647.00 [5]
9. Magnolia Construction Co., LL.C 38553 NO BID
P. O. Box 66096, Baton Rouge, LA 70896
10. Neal Construction Company 8032 NO BID
P. O. Box 220; Morganza, LA 70759
11. Richard Price Contracting Co., LL‘C 14807 $ 774.400.00 2]
25509 Walker South Road; Denham Springs, LA 70726
12. Stranco, Inc.
i 16724 .
70459 Hwy. 59; Abita Springs, LA 70420 ¥ 810,667.50 [4]
13. T. L. Wallace Constructlfm, Inc. 14422 NO BID
4025 Hwy. 35 North; Columbia, MS 39429
14. Warner Trucking, Inc.
67393 Z. McDaniel Road; Franklinton, LA 70438 60826 $ 691,537.50 [1]
NOTES TO BID OPENING:
[a] none
[b]
[c]
[d]
[e]

Certified Correct: // W/ /; Date: 20-Apr-2018

Webb M. Anderson, P.E.
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BID TABULATION

Bid Opening: Friday, April 20, 2018, 10:00 a.m.

Drainage Improvements [FY 2018] - for the City of Hammond

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers

Bid Engineer's Estimate Warner Trucking Richard Price Industrial Enterprises Stranco, Inc.
ltem Description Bid Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1.|Mobilization 1 EA | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00| $ 35,500.00 |$ 35500.00]¢$ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00| $ 28,750.00 | $ 28,750.00| $ 55,000.00 | $ 55,000.00
2.|Haul-in/grade/compact BACKFILL 3,000 CY 15.00 45,000.00 11.00 33,000.00 14.00 42,000.00 16.88 50,640.00 13.50 40,500.00
3.|Miscellaneous Clearing & Sitework 1 EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 19,742.50 19,742.50 16,700.00 16,700.00
4. [Construction Traffic Signage 1 EA 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 8,000.00 8,000.00 5,175.00 5,175.00 5,000.00 5,000.00
5.|Install flowable fill 50 CY 150.00 7,500.00 125.00 6,250.00 170.00 8,500.00 134.40 6,720.00 154.00 7,700.00
6.|Install/open cut 15" ACCMP(A) 1,200 LF 32.00 38,400.00 31.00 37,200.00 33.25 39,900.00 35.52 42,624.00 38.00 45,600.00
7.{Install/open cut 18" ACCMP(A) 3,800 LF 35.00 133,000.00 42.00 159,600.00 40.50 153,900.00 41.15 156,370.00 42.00 159,600.00
8.|Install/open cut 24" ACCMP(A) 550 LF 45.00 24.750.00 45.00 24,750.00 52.00 28,600.00 53.90 29,645.00 58.00 31,900.00
9.|Install/open cut 30" ACCMP(A) 270 LF 60.00 16,200.00 63.00 17,010.00 75.00 20,250.00 73.93 19,961.10 80.00 21,600.00
10.|Remove existing Pipe/Catch Basin 2,200 LF 10.00 22,000.00 7.00 15,400.00 20.00 44,000.00 6.87 15,114.00 6.00 13,200.00
11.|Clean & Video storm drain (12" - 18" diameter) 1,150 LF 5.00 5,750.00 5.50 6,325.00 4.50 5,175.00 5.60 6,440.00 5.50 6,325.00
12.|Clean & Video storm drain (24" - 36" diameter) 350 LF 6.00 2,100.00 9.35 3,272.50 5.50 1,925.00 9.52 3,332.00 9.35 3,272.50
13.{CIPP (24" - 30" diameter) 200 LF 150.00 30,000.00 153.65 30,730.00 180.00 36,000.00 156.45 31,290.00 125.00 25,000.00
14.{Type VI Catch Basin 17 EA 1,800.00 30,600.00 1,750.00 29,750.00 2,350.00 39,950.00 1,725.00 29,325.00 2,750.00 46,750.00
15.|Type VIII Catch Basin 51 EA 1,600.00 81,600.00 1,400.00 71,400.00 1,650.00 84,150.00 1,437.50 73,312.50 2,050.00 104,550.00
16.|Clean/access existing catch basin 2 EA 1,000.00 2,000.00 800.00 1,600.00 1,000.00 2,000.00 1,150.00 2,300.00 150.00 300.00
17.|Tie-in new pipe to existing RCB/catch basin 11 EA 1,000.00 11,000.00 700.00 7,700.00 1,000.00 11,000.00 769.06 8,459.66 1,100.00 12,100.00
18.|Install Concrete Collar/tie-in exist. Pipes 17 EA 500.00 8,500.00 300.00 5,100.00 750.00 12,750.00 172.50 2,932.50 600.00 10,200.00
19.|SAWCUT pavements (6" - 8" th.) 1,500 LF 6.00 9,000.00 4.50 6,750.00 9.50 14,250.00 7.70 11,550.00 10.00 15,000.00
20.|Remove/replace 8" th. STREET 150 SY 100.00 15,000.00 98.00 14,700.00 105.00 15,750.00 153.03 22,954.50 110.00 16,500.00
21.|R/R 6" th. SIDEWALK/Driveway/Shldr 900 SY 60.00 54,000.00 56.00 50,400.00 67.00 60,300.00 86.77 78,093.00 75.00 67,500.00
22.|Install Slab SOD 1,500 SY 6.00 9,000.00 5.00 7,500.00 4.00 6,000.00 6.60 9,900.00 6.00 9,000.00
23.|Haul-in/mix Root Zone matl (pre-sod) 2,000 CF 1.00 2,000.00 1.00 2,000.00 1.25 2,500.00 1.10 2,200.00 1.50 3,000.00
24.|Haul-in/grade Limestone - truck meas. 100 TN 50.00 5,000.00 45.00 4,500.00 60.00 6,000.00 50.40 5,040.00 50.00 5,000.00
25.|Install 551b Limestone (18" thick) 20 SY 150.00 3,000.00 135.00 2,700.00 140.00 2,800.00 89.60 1,792.00 120.00 2,400.00
26.|Install Type Il Ditch 100 LF 10.00 1,000.00 6.00 600.00 10.00 1,000.00 3.45 345.00 10.00 1,000.00
27.|Remove/replace PCC CURB 20 LF 50.00 1,000.00 40.00 800.00 50.00 1,000.00 23.00 460.00 50.00 1,000.00
28.|Install Timber Bulkhead 150 LF 2,000.00 300,000.00 388.00 58,200.00 170.00 25,500.00 486.39 72,958.50 255.00 38,250.00
29.|Install Timber Piles 14 EA 1,000.00 14,000.00 2,000.00 28,000.00 2,200.00 30,800.00 2,000.00 28,000.00 1,200.00 16,800.00
30.{Remove existing bulkhead 1 EA 10,000.00 10,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 12,000.00 12,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 9,000.00 9,000.00
31.|R/R Wood Fence/Gates 120 LF 50.00 6,000.00 35.00 4,200.00 60.00 7,200.00 34.50 4,140.00 25.00 3,000.00
32.|Type II Catch Basin 4 EA 3,000.00 12,000.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 3,250.00 13,000.00 3,360.00 13,440.00 3,000.00 12,000.00
33.]Offset existing Water Main (4" - 8") 1 EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 6,500.00 6,500.00 4,480.00 4,480.00 4,500.00 4,500.00
34.|Remove Existing Catch Basin 7 EA 500.00 3,500.00 300.00 2,100.00 600.00 4,200.00 200.00 1,400.00 250.00 1,750.00
Total BASE BID [items "1." through "34."]:| $ 939,900.00 | $ 691,537.50 | $ 774,400.00 | $ 803,886.26 | $ 810,997.50
Notes to Bid Opening: (a) none
(b)
Certified Correct: M /{é j ! ( . 20-Apr-2018

Webb M. Anderson, P.E.
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BID TABULATION

Bid Opening: Friday, April 20, 2018, 10:00 a.m.

Drainage Improvements [FY 2018] - for the City of Hammond

Engineer: Spangler Engineering, LLC, Consulting Civil Engineers

Bid Engineer's Estimate Magee Excavation Hard Rock Construction Byron E. Talbot Beverly Construction
ltem Description Bid Quantity Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Exiension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
1.|Mobilization 1 EA | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00| $ 20,000.00 [ $ 20,000.00|$ 54,000.00| $ 54,000.00] $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 114,991.00 [ $ 114,991.00
2.|Haul-in/grade/compact BACKFILL 3,000 CY 15.00 45,000.00 20.00 60,000.00 12.00 36,000.00 16.00 48,000.00 12.50 37,500.00
3.|Miscellaneous Clearing & Sitework 1 EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 26,000.00 26,000.00 15,200.00 15,200.00
4.|Construction Traffic Signage 1 EA 2,000.00 2,000.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 2,500.00 2,500.00 12,000.00 12,000.00 37,000.00 37,000.00
5.|Install flowable fill 50 CY 150.00 7,500.00 100.00 5,000.00 90.00 4,500.00 160.00 8,000.00 160.00 8,000.00
6.|Install/open cut 15" ACCMP(A) 1,200 LF 32.00 38,400.00 58.00 69,600.00 48.00 57,600.00 60.00 72,000.00 51.00 61,200.00
7.{Install/open cut 18" ACCMP(A) 3,800 LF 35.00 133,000.00 65.00 247,000.00 56.00 212,800.00 64.00 243,200.00 61.00 231,800.00
8.|Install/open cut 24" ACCMP(A) 550 LF 45.00 24,750.00 69.00 37,950.00 72.00 39,600.00 83.00 45,650.00 69.00 37,950.00
9.|Install/open cut 30" ACCMP(A) 270 LF 60.00 16,200.00 75.00 20,250.00 90.00 24,300.00 73.00 19,710.00 80.00 21,600.00
10.|Remove existing Pipe/Catch Basin 2,200 LF 10.00 22,000.00 1.00 2,200.00 2.00 4,400.00 18.00 39,600.00 21.00 46,200.00
11.[Clean & Video storm drain (12" - 18" diameter) 1,150 LF 5.00 5,750.00 13.40 15,410.00 6.00 6,900.00 5.50 6,325.00 8.00 9,200.00
12.{Clean & Video storm drain (24" - 36" diameter) 350 LF 6.00 2,100.00 18.00 6,300.00 8.00 2,800.00 9.35 3,272.50 9.00 3,150.00
13.|CIPP (24" - 30" diameter) 200 LF 150.00 30,000.00 115.00 23,000.00 105.00 21,000.00 154.00 30,800.00 327.00 65,400.00
14.|Type VI Catch Basin 17 EA 1,800.00 30,600.00 2,400.00 40,800.00 2,300.00 39,100.00 2,900.00 49,300.00 3,380.00 57,460.00
15.|Type VIII Catch Basin 51 EA 1,600.00 81,600.00 2,000.00 102,000.00 1,800.00 91,800.00 2,200.00 112,200.00 2,969.00 151,419.00
16.|Clean/access existing catch basin 2 EA 1,000.00 2,000.00 500.00 1,000.00 350.00 700.00 550.00 1,100.00 900.00 1,800.00
17.|Tie-in new pipe to existing RCB/catch basin 11 EA 1,000.00 11,000.00 335.00 3,685.00 650.00 7,150.00 1,100.00 12,100.00 2,000.00 22,000.00
18.|Install Concrete Collar/tie-in exist. Pipes - 17 EA 500.00 8,500.00 335.00 5,695.00 650.00 11,050.00 1,100.00 18,700.00 2,350.00 39,950.00
19.|SAWCUT pavements (6" - 8" th.) 1,500 LF 6.00 9,000.00 9.00 13,500.00 5.50 8,250.00 10.00 15,000.00 7.50 11,250.00
20.|Remove/replace 8" th. STREET 150 SY 100.00 15,000.00 100.00 15,000.00 135.00 20,250.00 160.00 24,000.00 79.00 11,850.00
21.|R/R 6" th. SIDEWALK/Driveway/Shldr 900 SY 60.00 54,000.00 55.00 49,500.00 81.00 72,900.00 88.00 79,200.00 71.00 63,900.00
22.|Install Slab SOD 1,500 SY 6.00 9,000.00 3.50 5,250.00 5.50 8,250.00 6.60 9,900.00 10.00 15,000.00
23.|Haul-in/mix Root Zone matl (pre-sod) 2,000 CF 1.00 2,000.00 0.90 1,800.00 2.25 4,500.00 2.80 5,600.00 2.50 5,000.00
24.|Haul-in/grade Limestone - truck meas. 100 TN 50.00 5,000.00 50.00 5,000.00 62.00 6,200.00 52.00 5,200.00 48.00 4,800.00
25.|Install 551b Limestone (18" thick) 20 SY 150.00 3,000.00 60.00 1,200.00 165.00 3,300.00 105.00 2,100.00 139.00 2,780.00
26.|Install Type II Ditch 100 LF 10.00 1,000.00 10.00 1,000.00 8.00 800.00 10.25 1,025.00 9.00 900.00
27.|Remove/replace PCC CURB 20 LF 50.00 1,000.00 15.00 300.00 45.00 900.00 15.00 300.00 20.00 400.00
28.|Install Timber Bulkhead 150 LF 2,000.00 { 300,000.00 150.00 22,500.00 235.00 35,250.00 335.00 50,250.00 205.00 30,750.00
29.|Install Timber Piles 14 EA 1,000.00 14,000.00 500.00 7,000.00 2,300.00 32,200.00 1,100.00 15,400.00 1,100.00 15,400.00
30.|Remove existing bulkhead 1 EA 10,000.00 10,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 9,000.00 9,000.00 15,000.00 15,000.00 9,000.00 9,000.00
31.{R/R Wood Fence/Gates 120 LF 50.00 6,000.00 50.00 6,000.00 35.00 4,200.00 35.00 4,200.00 44.00 5,280.00
32.|Type II Catch Basin 4 EA 3,000.00 12,000.00 2,800.00 11,200.00 2,500.00 10,000.00 2,600.00 10,400.00 3,180.00 12,720.00
33.|Offset existing Water Main (4" - 8") 1 EA 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 5,000.00 8,500.00 8,500.00 4,000.00 4,000.00 7,500.00 7,500.00
34.|Remove Existing Catch Basin 7 EA 500.00 3,500.00 1.00 7.00 350.00 2,450.00 550.00 3,850.00 950.00 6,650.00
Total BASE BID [items "1." through "34.":| $ 939,900.00 | $ 817,647.00 | $ 863,150.00 | $ 1,020,382.50 | $ ,165,000.00
Notes to Bid Opening: (a) none
(b)
Certified Correct: 7 //(4 Z 20-Apr-2018

ebb M. Anderson P.E.
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