
City of Hammond  
RFP 23-30 

Solid Waste Collection and Disposal  

CONTRACTOR 

Two times per week 
Contractor provides 

and maintains 
carts/cans 

Recycling  
 Roll off dumpster 

 
Per emptying of 
roll off 4 times a 

month 
        
Amwaste $21.95 per unit * $675.00 per roll off $675.00  

TOTALS: $196,189.10   $2,700.00 
Pelican Waste & Debris**  $24.05  per unit                   $75.00 per roll off $500.00 

TOTALS: $214,958.90    $2,000.00 
Waste Management  No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Republic Services  No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Waste Pro  $20.48 per unit $185.00 per roll off 
$490.00 + $80.00 

per ton 

TOTALS: $176,414.72   
$1,960.00 + 

$80.00 per ton 
   *Amwaste price based on current services rather than proposed scope of work reduction. 

   **Alternate Proposal  
Pelican Waste & Debris $21.15 One-time  per week Contractor provides and maintains 

carts/cans (95 gallons) Total $189,038.70 
 

Proposals were due in by 10:00 a. m. Wednesday, September 7, 2022 

Present at Opening:  
Jana Soileau, Purchasing Manager, Krystle Noto, Purchasing Agent, Jolene Johnson(Waste Pro), Dustin Fortenberry (Amwaste), Donald Hains (Waste 
Management), Lauren Anthony (Amwaste), Kevin B. (Pelican Waste & Debris), Steve Smith (Republic Services) and Mayor Zabbia  (Ponchatoula) 


